
L U X U R Y  H A R D W A R E

2 0 2 0  G e n e r a l  C a t a l o g u e



ABOUT
BRAND

STORY

MANIGLI creates luxury and 
timeless hardware,  bringing 
unique and outstanding products 
that will satisfy different needs 
and requirements.
By investing in design and 
innovation, the company, has 
succeeded in redefining the 
quality and stylistic standards  
with its ability to adapt an 
innovative style and create 
completely new design 
experience, helping people to live 
beautifully.
Its comprehensive product range 
carries the idea of architectural 
design intended for each 
residential and commercial  
project thanks to the exceptional 
quality and seamless design.

MISSION

MANIGLI’S  mission and 
philosophy is to bring the Italian 
design and quality  to the 
attention of architecture and 
design firms, offering the 
opportunity to enjoy the best 
designers’ masterpieces in their 
home.
Every single model is created and 
manufactured with aesthetics and 
aim to bring personality to your 
style. This is why we don’t think in 
terms of products, but of style 
collections we create.

VISION

MANIGLI has taken a commit-
ment with its customers and with 
itself: every achievement, every 
created piece must tell a clear and 
unique history of passion and the 
highest research results, that 
comes from every detail.
A story that can be understood 
even at first glance, but first of all 
that can be appreciated even by 
the most demanding customer.
The beauty of a product of 
excellence must be accompanied 
by the maximum level of quality, 
for those who are constantly 
looking for a luxury hardware, 
intended to last beyond fashion, 
which exceeds the judgment of 
time.



S T R E A M L I N E





AMARA
DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer
Giovanni Crosera



AMARA

FINISHES

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer
Giovanni Crosera

Black White

Bronze Matt



TERRA

DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano



TERRA

FINISHES

DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Black White

Bronze Matt



DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera

ETERNA



ETERNA

FINISHES

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Black White

DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera

Bronze Matt

Satin Nickel



MOZZA
DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera



MOZZA

FINISHES

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Black White

DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera

Bronze Matt



ETERNA DUE
DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera



ETERNA DUE

FINISHES

Bronze Matt

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Black White

DESIGNER

Mario Mazzer 
Giovanni Crosera



D E S I G N





FIATO
DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano 
Roberto Grossi



FIATO

FINISHES

Satin Bronze

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Polished Brass Satin Brass

DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano 
Roberto Grossi



ZETA
DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano 
Roberto Grossi



ZETA

FINISHES

Satin Bronze

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Polished Brass Satin Brass

DESIGNER

Maurizio Giordano 
Roberto Grossi



DESIGNER

Pedrizzetti & Associati

ALEA



ALEA

FINISHES

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Polished Brass Satin Brass

DESIGNER

Pedrizzetti & Associati

Bronze Matt



DESIGNER

Dario Grasselli
Paolo Pedrizzetti

ARIA



FINISHES

Satin Nickel

Chrome Plated Satin Chrome

Polished Brass Satin Brass

Satin Bronze

DESIGNER

Dario Grasselli
Paolo Pedrizzetti

ARIA



DESIGNER

Dorina Camusso

CIELO



FINISHES

Satin Nickel

Satin Chrome Black Chrome

Polished Brass Satin Brass

Chrome Plated

CIELO

DESIGNER

Dorina Camusso



AVIERO



AVIERO

FINISHES

White Pearl

Black Pearl Titan

Nickel Pearl

Satin Chrome



EVORA



Satin Chrome

EVORA

FINISHES

White Pearl

Bright Chrome Black Pearl

Titan Nickel Pearl



SINTRA



SINTRA

FINISHES

Nickel Pearl

Bright Chrome Black Pearl

Titan

Satin Chrome



CLAIRE SWAROWSKI



CLAIRE SWAROWSKI

FINISHES

Nickel Pearl

Bright ChromeSatin Chrome Titan



   
 

 

Tel: +1 (844) 404-0440

Website: www.hintex.com
Email: info@hintex.com


